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Risk  Implications  Mitigation  Rating Comment  

Event Preamble Pre warn public that full 
government guidance is 
being followed 
throughout event. 

Assists in placing public in 
correct frame of mind 
prior to event 

 Publicity to ensure that 
no one with symptoms 
attempts to attend event 

Secure Market/Event 
Gateways 

Slows down entry to 
Market or Event  

Raises awareness of risk 
in public mindset 

 Use entrances as first line 
of defence.  Funnel public 
in using barriers and hash 
tape causing attendees to 
hand sanitise and scan or 
sign in to track & trace 

Maintaining the 1 plus 
meter rule - social 
distancing – whilst 
browsing 

Follow government 
guidelines to slow 
infection rate 

Market to be a semi 
closed site (barriers) 
limiting entrance areas.  
One way system 
encouraged with 
marshals/ staff to monitor 
flow.  
2 meter markings at stalls 
so that customers 

 Limit net space of event 
to 2 persons per 10 
square metres. 
Signage throughout site 
reminding public of social 
distancing 
 
Discourage public from 
socially grouping or 
causing bottlenecks 

http://www.gov.uk/
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approach traders in an 
orderly fashion 
Encourage traders to 
allow a maximum of two 
persons to a 3 metre stall 
frontage 

during event ens ensuring 
gatherings of no more 
than 6 unless from same 
household. 

Maintaining the 1 plus 
meter rule – social 
distancing – whilst paying 

Follow Government 
guidelines to slow spread 
of infection 

To maintatain distance 
between customer an 
stall holder using tables 
and stall fittings as 
marker 

 Regular brifings sent out 
to traders along with in 
event monitoring 

Vulnerable traders ATM has obligation to 
encourage these groups 
to stay at home 

   

Staff contraction / spread 
of virus 

ATM has an obligation to 
protect its staff from large 
gatherings of people. 

  Provide event staff with 
appropriate PPE 
Visors/Gloves etc.. 

Trader contraction / 
spread of virus 

ATM has an obligation to 
protect its contractors 
from infection 

Traders encouraged to 
wear PPE whether 
statutory or not 

 Provide event staff with 
appropriate PPE 
Visors/Gloves etc.. 

Spread of infection 
through stall products 

Infection spreading via 
human contact with stall 
items products or 
equipment 

Encourage stallholders to 
regularly sanitise 
equipment.  Demonstrate 
product to customer and 

 Maintain protocol 
through correspondence 
and monitoring 

http://www.gov.uk/
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discourage customer 
product handling 

Reputational damage - via 
public perception 

Negative publicity of 
market being open when 
government is 
encouraging social 
distancing and markets 
encourage volumes of 
people. 

Discourage mis-truths 
about markets being 
unsafe.  Whilst the risks 
are the same as indoor 
shopping there is 
mitigation for outdoor 
shopping. 

 Encourage safe outdoor 
shopping in publicity and 
through social media 

Reputational damage – 
via organiser, land owner 
or local authority 
perception 

Misunderstanding or 
misleading interpretations 
of Statutory Guidance by 
these bodys 

Ask perpetuant to 
mitigate their policy and 
offer advice where 
necessary 

 Keep in contact with local 
officials and land 
managers 

Distancing between stall 
holders 

Discourage social 
gathering between them 

Market layout to assist  A minimum of 2m 
between each bespoke 
stall moving left to right 
or right to left an 12m 
between facing stalls 

Collective Dispense & 
Waste 

Avoid Multi User points 
for collection of 
Sugar/Condiments/Cutlery 

 To avoid cross 
contamination 

 Traders selling Food & 
beverage to offer such 
needs at point of sale.  
Also to provide customer 
bin for disposal of 
wrappings etc.. 
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